GENERAL COUNSEL OF THE DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE
' 1600 DEFENSE PENTAGON
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20301-1600

GENERAL COUNSEL

JUN 0 4 2009

The Honorable Joseph Biden
President of the Senate
Washington, DC 20510

Dear Mr. President:

The Department of Defense requests that the Congress enact the enclosed
legislative proposals as part of the National Defense Authorization Bill for Fiscal Year
2010.

The purpose of each proposal is stated in the accompanying section-by-section
analysis.

The Office of Management and Budget advises that there is no objection, from the
standpoint of the Administration’s program, to the presenting of these legislative
proposals for your consideration and the consideration of the Congress.

Enclosure:
As stated



GENERAL COUNSEL OF THE DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE
1600 DEFENSE PENTAGON
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20301-1600

GENERAL COUNSEL

JUN 0 4 2009

The Honorable Nancy Pelosi
Speaker of the House of Representatives
Washington, DC 20515

Dear Madam Speaker:

The Department of Defense requests that the Congress enact the enclosed

legislative proposals as part of the National Defense Authorization Bill for Fiscal Year
2010.

The purpose of each proposal is stated in the accompanying section-by-section
analysis.

The Office of Management and Budget advises that there is no objection, from the
standpoint of the Administration’s program, to the presenting of these legislative
_ proposals for your consideration and the consideration of the Congress.

Enclosure:
As stated



	June 4 2009 Letters
	June 4 2009 Letters (2)


DIVISION B—MILITARY CONSTRUCTION AUTHORIZATIONS

Sec. 2001. Short title.
Sec. 2002. Expiration of authorizations and amounts required to be specified by law.

TITLE XXI—ARMY

Sec. 2101. Authorized Army construction and land acquisition projects.
Sec. 2102. Family housing.

Sec. 2103. Improvements to military family housing units.

Sec. 2104. Authorization of appropriations, Army.

Sec. 2105. Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2006 projects.

TITLE XXII—NAVY

Sec. 2201. Authorized Navy construction and land acquisition projects.

Sec. 2202. Family housing.

Sec. 2203. Improvements to military family housing units.

Sec. 2204. Authorization of appropriations, Navy.

Sec 2205. Madification and extension of authority to carry out certain fiscal year 2006 project.

TITLE XXII—AIR FORCE

Sec. 2301. Authorized Air Force construction and land acquisition projects.
Sec. 2302. Family housing.

Sec. 2303. Improvements to military family housing units.

Sec. 2304. Authorization of appropriations, Air Force.

Sec. 2305. Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2007 projects.
Sec. 2306. Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2006 projects.

TITLE XXIV—DEFENSE AGENCIES

Subtitle A—Defense Agency Authorizations
Sec. 2401. Authorized Defense Agencies construction and land acquisition projects.
Sec. 2402. Family housing.
Sec. 2403. Energy conservation projects.
Sec. 2404. Authorization of appropriations, Defense Agencies.
Sec 2405. Modification of authority to carry out certain fiscal year 2008 project.
Sec 2406. Modification of authority to carry out certain fiscal year 2009 project.
Sec. 2407. Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2007 project.

Subtitle B—Chemical Demilitarization Authorizations

Sec. 2411. Authorization of appropriations, chemical demilitarization construction, defense-wide.

TITLE XXV—NORTH ATLANTIC TREATY ORGANIZATION SECURITY INVESTMENT PROGRAM

Sec. 2501. Authorized NATO construction and land acquisition projects.
Sec. 2502. Authorization of appropriations, NATO.

TITLE XXVI—GUARD AND RESERVE FORCES FACILITIES
Sec. 2601. Authorization of appropriations, National Guard and Reserve.

Sec. 2602. Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2007 projects.
Sec. 2603. Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2006 project.





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

TITLE XXVII—BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVITIES

Sec. 2701. Authorization of appropriations for base closure and realignment activities funded through Department of
Defense Base Closure Account 1990.

Sec. 2702. Authorized base closure and realignment activities funded through Department of Defense Base
Closure Account 2005.

Sec. 2703. Authorization of appropriations for base closure and realignment activities funded through Department of
Defense Base Closure Account 2005.

XXVIII—GENERAL PROVISIONS
[Transmitted to Congress, May 13, 2009]

DIVISION B—MILITARY CONSTRUCTION

AUTHORIZATIONS

SECTION 2001. SHORT TITLE.

This division may be cited as the “Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2010”.

SEC. 2002. EXPIRATION OF AUTHORIZATIONS AND AMOUNTS REQUIRED TO
BE SPECIFIED BY LAW.

(a) EXPIRATION OF AUTHORIZATIONS AFTER THREE YEARS.—EXcept as provided in
subsection (b), all authorizations contained in titles XXI through XXVII for military construction
projects, land acquisition, family housing projects and facilities, and contributions to the North
Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Investment Program (and authorizations of appropriations
therefore) shall expire on the later of—

(1) October 1, 2012; or

(2) the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing funds for military construction
for fiscal year 2013.
(b) ExcepTiON.—Subsection (a) shall not apply to authorizations for military

construction projects, land acquisition, family housing projects and facilities, and contributions





10

11

12

13

to the North Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Investment Program (and authorizations of
appropriations therefore), for which appropriated funds have been obligated before the later of—
(1) October 1, 2012; or
(2) the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing funds for fiscal year 2013 for
military construction projects, land acquisition, family housing projects and facilities, or
contributions to the North Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Investment Program.

TITLE XXI—ARMY

SEC. 2101. AUTHORIZED ARMY CONSTRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION
PROJECTS.
(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2104(1), the Secretary of the Army may acquire real
property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations inside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Army: Inside the United States

State Installation or Location Amount

Alaska Fort Richardson $51,150,000

Fort Wainwright $198,000,000
Arizona Fort Huachuca $21,000,000
Arkansas Pine Bluff Arsenal $25,000,000
California Fort Irwin $9,500,000
Colorado Fort Carson $342,950,000
Florida Eglin Air Force Base $131,600,000
Georgia Fort Benning $295,300,000

Fort Gillem $10,800,000

Fort Stewart/Hunter Army Air Field $145,400,000
Hawalii Schofield Barracks $184,000,000

Wheeler Army Air Field $7,500,000
Kansas Fort Riley $162,400,000
Kentucky Fort Knox $70,000,000
Louisiana Fort Polk $49,000,000
Maryland Fort Detrick $39,000,000






State Installation or Location Amount
Missouri Fort Leonard Wood $163,000,000
New York Fort Drum $84,500,000
North Carolina | Fort Bragg $111,150,000

Sunn)_/ Point (Military Ocean $28.900,000
Terminal)
Oklahoma Fort Sill $90,500,000
McAlester Army Ammunition Plant $12,500,000
South Carolina | Fort Jackson $103,500,000
Naval Weapons Station, Charleston $21,800,000
Texas Fort Bliss $219,400,000
Fort Hood $32,100,000
Fort Sam Houston $19,800,000
Utah Dugway Proving Ground $25,000,000
Virginia Fort A.P. Hill $23,000,000
Fort Belvoir $37,900,000
Washington Fort Lewis $9,700,000
Total $2,725,350,000

(b) OuTsIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2104(2), the Secretary of the Army may acquire real

property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations outside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Army: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
Afghanistan Bagram Airfield $170,100,000
Germany Ansbach $31,700,000

Kleber Kaserne $20,000,000
Landstuhl $25,000,000
Japan Okinawa $6,000,000
Sagamihara $6,000,000
Korea Camp Humphreys $50,200,000
Kuwait Camp Avrifjan $82,000,000
Total $391,000,000

SEC. 2102. FAMILY HOUSING.

(a) CONSTRUCTION AND ACQUISITION.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the






10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

authorization of appropriations in section 2104(5)(A), the Secretary of the Army may construct
or acquire family housing units (including land acquisition and supporting facilities) at the

installations or locations, in the number of units, and in the amounts set forth in the following

table:
Army: Family Housing
Location Installation or Location Units Amount
Germany Baumholder 38 $18,000,000
Total $18,000,000

(b) PLANNING AND DESIGN.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization
of appropriations in section 2104(5)(A), the Secretary of the Army may carry out architectural
and engineering services and construction design activities with respect to the construction or
improvement of family housing units in an amount not to exceed $3,936,000.

SEC. 2103. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING UNITS.

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States Code, and using amounts appropriated
pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section 2104(5)(A), the Secretary of the Army
may improve existing military family housing units in an amount not to exceed $219,300,000.
SEC. 2104. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, ARMY.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2009, for military construction, land acquisition, and military family housing functions of the
Department of the Army in the total amount of $4,457,433,000 as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the United States authorized by
section 2101(a), $2,725,350,000.
(2) For military construction projects outside the United States authorized by

section 2101(b), $391,000,000.





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(3) For unspecified minor military construction projects authorized by section
2805 of title 10, United States Code, $23,000,000.

(4) For architectural and engineering services and construction design under
section 2807 of title 10, United States Code, $178,029,000.

(5) For military family housing functions:

(A) For construction and acquisition, planning and design, and
improvement of military family housing and facilities, $273,236,000.

(B) For support of military family housing (including the functions
described in section 2833 of title 10, United States Code), $523,418,000.

(6) For the construction of increment 4 of a brigade complex at Fort Lewis,
Washington, authorized by section 2101(a) of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2445), as
amended by section 20814 of the Continuing Appropriations Resolution, 2007 (division
B of Public Law 109-289), as added by section 2 of the Revised Continuing Resolution,
2007 (Public Law 110-5; 121 Stat 41), $102,000,000.

(7) For the construction of increment 3 of a brigade complex operational support
facility at Vicenza, Italy, authorized by section 2101(b) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (division B of Public Law 110-181; 122 Stat.
505), $23,500,000.

(8) For the construction of increment 3 of a brigade complex barracks/community
facility at Vicenza, Italy, authorized by section 2101(b) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (division B of Public Law 110-181; 122 Stat.

505), $22,500,000.





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

(9) For the construction of increment 3 of the U.S. Southern Command

headquarters building at Miami Doral, Florida, authorized by section 2101(a) of the

Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (division B of Public Law

110-181; 122 Stat. 504), $55,400,000.

(10) For the construction of increment 2 of a barracks and dining complex at Fort

Carson, Colorado, authorized by section 2101(a) of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2009 (division B of Public Law 110-417 122 Stat.

4659), $60,000,000.

(11) For the construction of increment 2 of a barracks and dining complex at Fort

Stewart, Georgia, authorized by section 2101(a) of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2009 (division B of Public Law 110-417 122 Stat.

4659), $80,000,000.

SEC. 2105. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006

PROJECTS.

(a) ExTENsION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3501),

authorizations set forth in the table in subsection (b), as provided in section 2101 of that Act,

shall remain in effect until October 1, 2010, or the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing

funds for military construction for fiscal year 2011, whichever is later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a) is as follows:

Army: Extensions of 2006 Project Authorizations

State/Country | Installation or Location Project Amount
Hawaii Pohakuloa Training Area | Tactical vehicle wash facility $9,207,000
Pohakuloa Training Area | Battle Area Complex $33,660,000






TITLE XXII—NAVY

SEC. 2201. AUTHORIZED NAVY CONSTRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION
PROJECTS.
(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2204(1), the Secretary of the Navy may acquire real
property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations inside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Navy: Inside the United States

State Installation or Location Amount
Arizona Marine Corps Air Station, Yuma $28,770,000
California M(_)untaln Warfare Training Center, $4.460,000

Bridgeport
Edwards Air Force Base $3,007,000
Marine Corps Air Station, Miramar $9,280,000
Marine Corps Base, Camp Pendleton $775,162,000
Naval Base Point Loma $8,730,000
Marine Corps Recruit Depot, San Diego $23,590,000
Marine Alr_Ground Combat Center $513,680,000
Twentynine Palms
Florida Il\éllzrr:ge Corps Support Facility, Blount $3,760.000
Eglin Air Force Base $50,847,000
Naval Air Station, Jacksonville $5,917,000
Naval Air Station, Whiting Field $4,120,000
Naval Station, Mayport $75,985,000
Pensacola $26,161,000
Hawaii Naval Station Pearl Harbor $35,182,000
Marine Corps Base, Hawaii $5,380,000
North_ Marine Corps Air Station, Cherry Point $22,960,000
Carolina
Marine Corps Air Station, New River $107,090,000
Marine Corps Base, Camp Lejeune $673,570,000
Rhode Island | Naval Station, Newport $45,803,000
South Marine Corps Air Station, Beaufort $1,280,000
Carolina
Marine Corps Recruit Depot, Parris Island $6,972,000
Texas Naval Air Station, Corpus Christi $19,764,000






10

State Installation or Location Amount
Virginia Marine Corps Base, Quantico $105,240,000
Naval Amphibious Base, Little Creek $13,095,000
Naval Station, Norfolk $18,139,000
Norfolk Naval Shipyard $226,969,000
Washington | Spokane $12,707,000
Total $2,827,620,000

(b) OuTsIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2204(2), the Secretary of the Navy may acquire real
property and carry out military construction projects for the installation or location outside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Navy: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
Bahrain Southwest Asia $41,526,000
Djibouti Djibouti $41,845,000
Guam Naval Activities, Guam $414,196,000
Spain Naval Station, Rota $26,278,000

Total $523,845,000

SEC. 2202. FAMILY HOUSING.

(a) CONSTRUCTION AND ACQUISITION.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2204(5)(A), the Secretary of the Navy may construct or
acquire family housing units (including land acquisition and supporting facilities) at the
installations or locations, in the number of units, and in the amount set forth in the following

table:

Navy: Family Housing

Location Installation or Location Units Amount
Welcome
Korea Pusan center/ $4,376,000
warehouse
Mariana Islands | Naval Activities, Guam 30 $20,730,000





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

| | [ Total | $25,106,000 |

(b) PLANNING AND DESIGN.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization
of appropriations in section 2204(5)(A), the Secretary of the Navy may carry out architectural
and engineering services and construction design activities with respect to the construction or
improvement of family housing units in an amount not to exceed $2,771,000.

SEC. 2203. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING UNITS.

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States Code, and using amounts appropriated
pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section 2204(5)(A), the Secretary of the Navy
may improve existing military family housing units in an amount not to exceed $118,692,000.
SEC. 2204. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, NAVY.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2009, for military construction, land acquisition, and military family housing functions of the
Department of the Navy in the total amount of $4,278,373,000, as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the United States authorized by
section 2201(a), $2,827,620,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside the United States authorized by
section 2201(b), $523,845,000.

(3) For unspecified minor military construction projects authorized by section

2805 of title 10, United States Code, $12,483,000.

(4) For architectural and engineering services and construction design under
section 2807 of title 10, United States Code, $166,896,000.
(5) For military family housing functions:

(A) For construction and acquisition, planning and design, and

10





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

improvement of military family housing and facilities, $146,569,000.

(B) For support of military family housing (including functions described
in section 2833 of title 10, United States Code), $368,540,000.

(6) For the construction of increment 2 of a replacement maintenance pier at
Bremerton, Washington, authorized by section 2201(a) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (division B of Public Law 110-181; 122 Stat.
510), $69,064,000.

(7) For the construction of increment 3 of a submarine drive-in magazine
silencing facility at Naval Base Pearl Harbor, Hawaii, authorized by section 2201(a) of
the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (division B of Public
Law 110-181; 122 Stat. 510), $8,645,000.

(8) For the construction of increment 6 of a limited area production and storage
complex at Bangor, Washington, authorized by section 2201(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2005 (division B of Public Law 108-375;
118 Stat. 2106), $87,292,000.

(9) For the construction of increment 2 of enclave fencing at Naval Submarine
Base, Bangor, Washington, authorized by section 2201(a) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3490), $67,419,000.

SEC. 2205. MODIFICATION AND EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT

CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006 PROJECT.

(a) MopIFICATION.—The table in section 2201(a) of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3490) is

11





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

amended in the item relating to Naval Submarine Base, Bangor, Washington, by striking
“$60,160,000” and inserting “$127,163,000”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 2204(b) of that Act (119 Stat. 3492) is
amended by adding at the end the following new subparagraph:

“(11) $67,003,000 (the balance of the amount authorized under section 2201(a)
for construction of a waterfront security enclave at Naval Submarine Base, Bangor,
Washington).”.

(c) ExTENSION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3501), the
authorization relating to enclave fencing/parking at Naval Submarine Base, Bangor, Washington
(formerly referred to as a project at Naval Submarine Base, Bangor, Washington), as provided in
section 2201 of that Act, shall remain in effect until October 1, 2012, or the date of an Act
authorizing funds for military construction for fiscal year 2013, whichever is later.

TITLE XXII1—AIR FORCE

SEC. 2301. AUTHORIZED AIR FORCE CONSTRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION
PROJECTS.
(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2304(1), the Secretary of the Air Force may acquire
real property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations inside

the United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Air Force: Inside the United States

State Installation or Location Amount
Alaska Clear Air Force Station $24,300,000
Elmendorf Air Force Base $15,700,000

12





Arizona Davis-Monthan Air Force Base $41,900,000
Arkansas Little Rock Air Force Base $5,800,000
California Travis Air Force Base $6,900,000
Vandenberg Air Force Base $13,000,000
Colorado Peterson Air Force Base $25,100,000
United States Air Force Academy $17,500,000
Delaware Dover Air Force Base $17,400,000
Florida Eglin Air Force Base $59,800,000
Hurlburt Field $10,500,000
MacDill Air Force Base $38,300,000
Hawalii Wheeler Air Force Base $15,000,000
Idaho Mountain Home Air Force Base $20,000,000
Maryland Andrews Air Force Base $9,300,000
Nevada Creech Air Force Base $2,700,000
New Mexico | Cannon Air Force Base $15,000,000
Holloman Air Force Base $5,500,000
Kirtland Air Force Base $16,700,000
North Dakota | Minot Air Force Base $11,500,000
Ohio Wright-Patterson Air Force Base $48,000,000
Oklahoma Altus Air Force Base $20,300,000
Tinker Air Force Base $13,037,000
Texas Dyess Air Force Base $4,500,000
Goodfellow Air Force Base $32,400,000
Lackland Air Force Base $113,879,000
Utah Hill Air Force Base $21,053,000
Virginia Langley Air Force Base $10,000,000
Wyoming Francis E Warren Air Force Base $9,100,000
Total $644,169,000

(b) OuTsIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2304(2), the Secretary of the Air Force may acquire
real property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations outside

the United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Air Force: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
Afghanistan Bagram Air Base $22,000,000
Colombia Palanquero Air Base $46,000,000
Germany Ramstein Air Base $34,700,000

Spangdahlem Air Base $23,500,000
Guam Andersen Air Force Base $58,202,000

13





Country Installation or Location Amount
Italy Naval Air Station Sigonella $31,300,000
Oman Al Musannah Air Base $116,000,000
Qatar Al Udeid Air Base $60,000,000
Turkey Incirlik Air Base $9,200,000

Total $400,902,000

SEC. 2302. FAMILY HOUSING.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section
2304(5)(A), the Secretary of the Air Force may carry out architectural and engineering services
and construction design activities with respect to the construction or improvement of family
housing units in an amount not to exceed $4,314,000.

SEC. 2303. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING UNITS.

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States Code, and using amounts appropriated

pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section 2304(5)(A), the Secretary of the Air

Force may improve existing military family housing units in an amount not to exceed

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

$61,787,000.

SEC. 2304. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, AIR FORCE.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September

30, 2009, for military construction, land acquisition, and military family housing functions of the

Department of the Air Force in the total amount of $1,714,471,000, as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the United States authorized by

section 2301(a), $644,169,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside the United States authorized by

section 2301(b), $400,902,000.

(3) For unspecified minor military construction projects authorized by section

2805 of title 10, United States Code, $18,000,000.

14





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

(4) For architectural and engineering services and construction design under

section 2807 of title 10, United States Code, $82,363,000.

(5) For military family housing functions:

(A) For construction and acquisition, planning and design, and

improvement of military family housing and facilities, $66,101,000.

(B) For support of military family housing (including functions described

in section 2833 of title 10, United States Code), $502,936,000.

SEC. 2305. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2007

PROJECTS.

(a) ExTENSION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2463),

authorizations set forth in the table in subsection (b), as provided in sections 2301 and 2302 of

that Act, shall remain in effect until October 1, 2010, or the date of the enactment of an Act

authorizing funds for military construction for fiscal year 2011, whichever is later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a) is as follows:

Air Force: Extensions of 2007 Project Authorizations

State Installation or Location Project Amount
Delaware Dover Air Force Base C-17 Aircrew Life Support $7,400,000
ldaho Mountain Home Air Force | Replace Family Housing (457 $107.800,000

Base

Units)

SEC. 2306. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006

PROJECTS.

(a) ExTENsION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3501),

authorizations set forth in the table in subsection (b), as provided in section 2302 of that Act,

15






10

11

shall remain in effect until October 1, 2010, or the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing

funds for military construction for fiscal year 2011, whichever is later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a) is as follows:

Air Force: Extensions of 2006 Project Authorizations

State/Country

Installation or Location

Project

Amount

Alaska

North Dakota

Eielson Air Force Base
Eielson Air Force Base

Grand Forks Air Force
Base

Replace Family Housing (92 Units) | $37,650,000
Purchase Build/Lease Housing (300 | $18,144,000

Units)
Replace Family Housing (150
Units)

$43,353,000

TITLE XXIV—DEFENSE AGENCIES

Subtitle A—Defense Agency Authorizations

SEC. 2401. AUTHORIZED DEFENSE AGENCIES CONSTRUCTION AND LAND

ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2404(1), the Secretary of Defense may acquire real

property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations inside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Defense Agencies: Inside the United States
Defense Education Activity

State Installation or Location Amount
Georgia Fort Benning $2,330,000
Fort Stewart/Hunter Army Air Field $45,003,000
North Carolina | Fort Bragg $3,439,000
Defense Information Systems Agency
State Installation or Location Amount
Hawaii Naval Station Pearl Harbor, Ford Island $9,633,000

Defense Logistics Agency

16






State Installation or Location Amount
California El Centro $11,000,000
Travis Air Force Base, California $15,357,000
Florida Jacksonville International Airport (Air National $11.500,000
Guard)
Minnesota 832:3; International Airport (Air National $15.000,000
Oklahoma Altus Air Force Base $2,700,000
Texas Fort Hood $3,000,000
Washington Fairchild Air Force Base $7,500,000
Missile Defense Agency
State Installation or Location Amount
Virginia Naval Support Facility, Dahlgren $24,500,000
National Security Agency
State Installation or Location Amount
Maryland Fort Meade $203,800,000
Utah Camp Williams $800,000,000
Special Operations Command
State Installation or Location Amount
California Naval Amphibious Base, Coronado $15,722,000
Colorado Fort Carson $48,246,000
Florida Eglin Air Force Base $3,046,000
Hurlburt Field $8,156,000
Georgia Fort Benning $3,046,000
Kentucky Fort Campbell $32,335,000
New Mexico Cannon Air Force Base $52,864,000
North Carolina | Fort Bragg $101,488,000
Marine Corps Base, Camp Lejeune $11,791,000
Virginia Naval Amphibious Base, Little Creek $18,669,000
Washington Fort Lewis $14,500,000
Tri-Care Management Activity
State Installation or Location Amount
Alaska Elmendorf Air Force Base $25,017,000
Fort Richardson $3,518,000
Colorado Fort Carson $52,773,000
Georgia Fort Benning $17,200,000
Fort Stewart/Hunter Army Air Field $26,386,000
Kentucky Fort Campbell $8,600,000
Maryland Fort Detrick $29,807,000
Missouri Fort Leonard Wood $5,570,000

17






North Carolina | Fort Bragg $57,658,000
Oklahoma Fort Sill $10,554,000
Texas Lackland Air Force Base $101,928,000
Fort Bliss $206,270,000
Washington Fort Lewis $15,636,000
Washington Headquarters Services
State Installation or Location Amount
Virginia Pentagon Reservation $27,672,000
Total $2,053,214,000

(b) OuTsIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2404(2), the Secretary of Defense may acquire real
property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations outside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Defense Agencies: Outside the United States

Defense Education Activity

Country Installation or Location Amount
Belgium Brussels $38,124,000
Germany Kaiserslautern $93,545,000

Wiesbaden Air Base $5,379,000
United Kingdom | Royal Air Force Lakenheath $4,509,000
Defense Intelligence Agency

Country Installation or Location Amount

Korea K-16 Airfield $5,050,000
Defense Logistics Agency

Country Installation or Location Amount
Cuba Naval Air Station, Guantanamo Bay $12,500,000
Guam Naval Air Station, Agana $4,900,000
Korea Osan Air Base $28,000,000
United Kingdom | Royal Air Force Mildenhall $4,700,000

National Security Agency

Country Installation or Location Amount

United Kingdom | Royal Air Force Menwith Hill Station $37,588,000

Tri-Care Management Activity

18






10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

Country Installation or Location Amount

Guam Naval Activities, Guam $259,156,000
United Kingdom | Royal Air Force Alconbury $14,227,000
Total $507,678,000

SEC. 2402. FAMILY HOUSING.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section
2405(7)(A), the Secretary of Defense may carry out architectural and engineering services and
construction design activities with respect to the construction or improvement of family housing
units in an amount not to exceed $2,859,000.

SEC. 2403. ENERGY CONSERVATION PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section
2404(6), the Secretary of Defense may carry out energy conservation projects under chapter 173
of title 10, United States Code, in the amount of $90,000,000.

SEC. 2404. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, DEFENSE AGENCIES.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2009, for military construction, land acquisition, and military family housing functions of the
Department of Defense (other than the military departments) in the total amount of
$3,175,424,000, as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the United States authorized by
section 2401(a), $1,964,214,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside the United States authorized by
section 2401(b), $507,678,000.

(3) For unspecified minor military construction projects under section 2805 of

title 10, United States Code, $36,025,000.

19





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(4) For contingency construction projects of the Secretary of Defense under
section 2804 of title 10, United States Code, $10,000,000.

(5) For architectural and engineering services and construction design under
section 2807 of title 10, United States Code, $137,942,000.

(6) For energy conservation projects authorized by section 2403 of this Act,
$90,000,000.

(7) For support of military family housing, including functions described in
section 2833 of title 10, United States Code, and credits to the Department of Defense
Family Housing Improvement Fund under section 2883 of title 10, United States Code,
and the Homeowners Assistance Fund established under section 1013 of the
Demonstration Cities and Metropolitan Development Act of 1966 (42 U.S.C. 3374),
$77,898,000.

(8) For the construction of increment 2 of replacement fuel storage facilities at
Point Loma Annex, California, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2008 (division B of Public Law 110-181;
122 Stat. 521), $92,300,000.

(9) For the construction of increment 3 of a special operations facility at Dam
Neck, Virginia, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Construction Authorization
Act of Fiscal Year 2008 (division B of Public Law 110-181; 122 Stat. 521), $15,967,000.

(10) For the construction of increment 2 of the USAMRICD replacement facility
at Aberdeen Proving Ground, Maryland, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2009 (division B of Public Law 110-417

122 Stat. 4689), $111,400,000.

20





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(11) For the construction of increment 4 of the USAMRIID stage | facility at Fort

Detrick, Maryland, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Construction

Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat.

2457), $108,000,000.

(12) For the construction of fuel storage tanks and pipeline replacement at Souda

Bay, Greece, authorized by section 2401(b) of the Military Construction Authorization

Act of Fiscal Year 2009 (division B of Public Law 110-417; 122 Stat. 4691),

$24,000,000.
SEC. 2405. MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT CERTAIN FISCAL

YEAR 2008 PROJECT.

(a) MopIFICATION.—The table relating to the Defense Logistics Agency in section 2401
(a) of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (division B of Public
Law 110-181; 122 Stat. 521) is amended in the item relating to Point Loma Annex, California,
by striking “$140,000,000” in the amount column and inserting “$195,000,000”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 2403(b)(2) of that Act (122 Stat.524) is
amended by striking “$84,300,000” and inserting “$139,300,000".
SEC. 2406. MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT CERTAIN FISCAL

YEAR 2009 PROJECT.

(a) MobIFicATION.—The table relating to the Defense Logistics Agency in section 2401
(b) of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2009 (division B of Public
Law 110-417; 122 Stat. 4691) is amended in the item relating to Souda Bay, Greece, by striking
“$8,000,000” in the amount column and inserting “$32,000,000”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 2403(b) of that Act (122 Stat. 4692) is

21





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

amended by adding at the end the following new paragraph:
“(5) $24,000,000 (the balance of the amount authorized for the Defense Logistics

Agency under section 2401(b) for fuel storage tanks and pipeline replacement at Souda

Bay, Greece).”.

SEC. 2407. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2007
PROJECT.

(a) ExTENSION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2463),
authorizations set forth in the table in subsection (b), as provided in section 2402 of that Act,
shall remain in effect until October 1, 2010, or the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing
funds for military construction for fiscal year 2011, whichever is later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a) is as follows:

Defense Agencies: Extensions of 2007 Project Authorizations
Defense Logistics Agency

State Installation or Location Project Amount
Virginia Defense Supply Center Whole House Renovation $484,000
Richmond

Subtitle B—Chemical Demilitarization Authorizations
SEC. 2411. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, CHEMICAL
DEMILITARIZATION CONSTRUCTION, DEFENSE-WIDE.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2009, for military construction and land acquisition for chemical demilitarization in the total
amount of $146,541,000, as follows:

(1) For the construction of phase 11 of a chemical munitions demilitarization

22






10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

facility at Pueblo Chemical Activity, Colorado, authorized by section 2401(a) of the
Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 1997 (division B of Public Law
104-201; 110 Stat. 2775), as amended by section 2406 of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2000 (division B of Public Law 106-65; 113 Stat. 839),
section 2407 of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2003
(division B of Public Law 107-314; 116 Stat. 2698), and section 2413 of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2009 (division B of Public Law 110-417,
122 Stat. 4697), $92,500,000.

(3) For the construction of phase 10 of a munitions demilitarization facility at
Blue Grass Army Depot, Kentucky, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2000 (division B of Public Law 106-65;
113 Stat. 835), as amended by section 2405 of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2002 (division B of Public Law 107-107; 115 Stat. 1298), section
2405 of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2003 (division B of
Public Law 107-314; 116 Stat. 2698), and section 2414 of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2009 (division B of Public Law 110-417; 122 Stat.

4697), $54,041,000.

TITLE XXV—NORTH ATLANTIC TREATY ORGANIZATION

SECURITY INVESTMENT PROGRAM

SEC. 2501. AUTHORIZED NATO CONSTRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION

PROJECTS.

The Secretary of Defense may make contributions for the North Atlantic Treaty

Organization Security Investment Program as provided in section 2806 of title 10, United States

23





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Code, in an amount not to exceed the sum of the amount authorized to be appropriated for this
purpose in section 2502 and the amount collected from the North Atlantic Treaty Organization as
a result of construction previously financed by the United States.
SEC. 2502. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, NATO.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2009, for contributions by the Secretary of Defense under section 2806 of title 10, United
States Code, for the share of the United States of the cost of projects for the North Atlantic
Treaty Organization Security Investment Program authorized by section 2501, in the amount of
$276,314,000.

TITLE XXVI—GUARD AND RESERVE FORCES FACILITIES

SEC. 2601. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, NATIONAL GUARD AND
RESERVE.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2009, for the costs of acquisition, architectural and engineering services, and construction of
facilities for the Guard and Reserve Forces, and for contributions therefore, under chapter 1803
of title 10, United States Code (including the cost of acquisition of land for those facilities), in
the following amounts:
(1) For the Department of the Army—
(A) for the Army National Guard of the United States, $426,491,000; and
(B) for the Army Reserve, $374,862,000.
(2) For the Department of the Navy, for the Navy and Marine Corps Reserve,
$64,124,000.

(3) For the Department of the Air Force—

24





10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

(A) for the Air National Guard of the United States, $128,261,000; and

(B) for the Air Force Reserve, $27,476,000.

SEC. 2602. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2007

(a) ExTENSION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction

PROJECTS.

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2463),

authorizations set forth in the table in subsection (b), as provided in section 2601 of that Act,

shall remain in effect until October 1, 2010, or the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing

funds for military construction for fiscal year 2011, whichever is later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a) is as follows:

Army National Guard: Extensions of 2007 Project Authorizations

State Installation or Location Project Amount
California Fresno AVCRAD Add/Alt, PH | $30,000,000
New Jersey Lakehurst Consolidated Logistics Training $20,024,000

Facility, PH |1

SEC. 2603. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006

(a) ExTENsION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction

PROJECT.

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3501),

authorizations set forth in the table in subsection (b), as provided in section 2601 of that Act,

shall remain in effect until October 1, 2010, or the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing

funds for military construction for fiscal year 2011, whichever is later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a) is as follows:

Army National Guard: Extension of 2006 Project Authorizations

State

| Installation or Location |

Project

| Amount

25






10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

Montana Townsend Automated Qualification Training $2,532,000
Range

TITLE XXVII—BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVITIES

SEC. 2701. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR BASE CLOSURE AND
REALIGNMENT ACTIVITIES FUNDED THROUGH DEPARTMENT OF
DEFENSE BASE CLOSURE ACCOUNT 1990.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2009, for base closure and realignment activities, including real property acquisition and
military construction projects, as authorized by the Defense Base Closure and Realignment Act
of 1990 (part A of title XXIX of Public Law 101-510; 10 U.S.C. 2687 note) and funded through
the Department of Defense Base Closure Account 1990 established by section 2906 of such Act,
in the total amount of $396,768,000.
SEC. 2702. AUTHORIZED BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVITIES
FUNDED THROUGH DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE BASE CLOSURE
ACCOUNT 2005.
Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section
2703, the Secretary of Defense may carry out base closure and realignment activities, including
real property acquisition and military construction projects, as authorized by the Defense Base
Closure and Realignment Act of 1990 (part A of title XXI1X of Public Law 101-510; 10 U.S.C.
2687 note) and funded through the Department of Defense Base Closure Account 2005
established by section 2906A of such Act, in the amount of $5,934,740,000.
SEC. 2703. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR BASE CLOSURE AND
REALIGNMENT ACTIVITIES FUNDED THROUGH DEPARTMENT OF

DEFENSE BASE CLOSURE ACCOUNT 2005.

26






Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2008, for base closure and realignment activities, including real property acquisition and
military construction projects, as authorized by the Defense Base Closure and Realignment Act
of 1990 (part A of title XXIX of Public Law 101-510; 10 U.S.C. 2687 note) and funded through
the Department of Defense Base Closure Account 2005 established by section 2906A of such
Act, in the total amount of $7,479,498,000.

XXVIII—GENERAL PROVISIONS

[Transmitted to Congress, May 13, 2009]

27





		Army: Outside the United States

		SEC. 2105. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006 PROJECTS.

		Army:  Extensions of 2006 Project Authorizations

		Navy: Outside the United States



		SEC. 2305. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2007 PROJECTS.

		SEC. 2306. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006 PROJECTS.

		Air Force:  Extensions of 2006 Project Authorizations

		Defense Agencies: Outside the United States



		SEC. 2407. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2007 PROJECT.

		Defense Agencies:  Extensions of 2007 Project Authorizations



		SEC. 2602. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2007 PROJECTS.

		Army National Guard:  Extensions of 2007 Project Authorizations



		SEC. 2603. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006

		Army National Guard:  Extension of 2006 Project Authorizations






SEC. . EXTENSION OF PREVIOUSLY AUTHORIZED DISPOSAL OF COBALT
FROM NATIONAL DEFENSE STOCKPILE.

Section 3305(a)(5) of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 1998
(Public Law 105-85; 50 U.S.C. 98d note), as most recently amended by section 1412(b) of the
Duncan Hunter National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2009 (Public Law 110-417;
122 Stat. 4648), is amended by striking “during fiscal year 2009” and inserting “by the end of

fiscal year 2011”.

Section-by-Section Analysis

The cobalt market tends to be volatile, and the current economic downturn has caused
demand for this material to be reduced significantly. The Defense National Stockpile Center
(DNSC) does not anticipate demand to increase in the short term. To be better able to meet the
statutory sales amount, DNSC has determined that cobalt sales authority needs to be extended
two years through Fiscal Year 2011.

Change to Existing Law: This proposal would make the following changes to section 3305 of
the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 1998:

SECTION 3305 OF THE NATIONAL DEFENSE
AUTHORIZATION ACT FOR FISCAL YEAR 1998
(PUBLIC LAW 105-85)

SEC. 3305. DISPOSAL OF COBALT IN NATIONAL DEFENSE STOCKPILE.

(a) DisPosAL REQUIRED.—Subject to subsections (b) and (c), the President shall dispose
of cobalt contained in the National Defense Stockpile so as to result in receipts to the United
States in total amounts not less than—

(1) $20,000,000 during fiscal year 2002;

(2) $50,000,000 during fiscal year 2003;

(3) $64,000,000 during fiscal year 2004;

(4) $67,000,000 during fiscal year 2005; and

(5) $34,000,000 during by the end fiscal year 2009 2011.

* * * * X% X% *






SEC. . EXEMPTION FROM FEDERAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE ACT FOR
COMBATANT COMMAND ADVISORY BODIES THAT INCLUDE
FOREIGN GOVERNMENT OR FOREIGN MILITARY MEMBERS.

Section 165 of title 10, United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the
following new subsection:

“(d) ADVISORY BODIES THAT INCLUDE FOREIGN GOVERNMENT OR FOREIGN MILITARY
MEMBERS.—A committee or similar group that advises or assists the commander of a combatant
command, or that advises or assists a subordinate commander who is under the authority of the
commander of a combatant command, and that includes members who are full-time, or
permanent part-time, officers or employees of a foreign government or foreign armed force shall
not be considered to be an advisory committee under section 3(2) of the Federal Advisory

Committee Act (5 U.S.C. App.) solely because of such membership.”.

Section-by-Section Analysis

This proposal would amend section 165 of title 10, United States Code, to exempt certain
advisory bodies operating within a combatant command from the Federal Advisory Committee
Act (FACA). The exemption would apply whenever foreign military and/or foreign government
personnel — including those assigned as part of the Headquarters (HQ), United States Central
Command (USCENTCOM) leadership and senior staff — become involved in providing
consensus staff recommendations / advice to the Commander, USCENTCOM or subordinate
USCENTCOM commanders such as the Commander, Multi-National Forces — Iraq or
Commander, U.S. Forces — Afghanistan. This would avoid the attendant administrative burdens
and “time delays” required for FACA compliance and would allow for a much swifter, much
better-informed development and execution of USCENTCOM Operational Plans and mission
plans. These plans and missions almost always involve combined operations with foreign / host-
nation forces.

FACA applies to any committee, team, or similar group that includes both United States
Government (USG) employees and non-USG persons that is established or used by a Federal
agency to obtain “consensus” recommendations or advice on issues or policies of USG interest.
Groups composed purely of USG employees or purely of non-USG persons are not subject to the
FACA. The Department of Defense is not exempt from FACA and there are, at present, no DoD
or “foreign / military policy” exceptions to the statute.





Commander, USCENTCOM has set up a CENTCOM Assessment Team (CAT) to
conduct a comprehensive review of the entire USCENTCOM Area of Responsibility (AOR)
which includes two active combat zones. The CAT is developing a draft Theater Strategy / draft
USCENTCOM Campaign Plan that would also serve as a framework document that the
Commander, USCENTCOM is expected to use in briefing and advising the President.

At present, the FACA would apply whenever a non-USG officer or official (e.g., a
foreign general / flag officer who is assigned to the HQ, USCENTCOM staff) becomes part of a
collective USCENTCOM staff effort to arrive at, or draft, collective “advice” from the staff to
the Commander, USCENTCOM. Foreign military and/or government officers could only
participate as CAT members if this HQs were to: 1) develop and file a charter that would go
through OSD, the General Services Agency, and Congress before meeting or conducting any
business; and, 2) maintain a “fairly balanced membership” in terms of the views of its members
(e.g., there should be a balancing of views on key topics such as whether there should be an OEF
“troop surge™); and, 3) hold open, public meetings whenever possible (to include public access to
VTC or other “teleconferencing”); and, 4) keep detailed minutes of all meetings; and, 5) allow
public filing of written statements to be considered by the CAT; and, 5) announce all meetings in
the Federal Register 15 days in advance; and, 6) maintain all unclassified committee documents
for public inspection, etc., etc.

The “FACA-avoidance” technique the CAT has been forced to use was to limit its
advisory committee membership strictly to USG personnel. This resulted in substantial “lost
potential” and benefit that could otherwise have been exploited if foreign allies and foreign
nation members of USCENTCOM headquarters staff (many of whom had substantial personal
military and diplomatic insights and experience within the USCENTCOM AOR) would have
been allowed to participate as full CAT members and be part of the collective “group advice”
ultimately offered to the Commander, USCENTCOM.

The amendment proposed to 10 U.S.C. 165 would “define out” foreign military and
foreign government officials from FACA in the same manner that U.S. military personnel and
USG officials are “defined out” from the FACA.

Changes to Existing Law: The proposal would make the following change to existing law:
TITLE 10, UNITED STATES CODE

§ 165. Combatant commands: administration and support

(@) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of Defense, with the advice and assistance of the
Chairman of the Joint Chiefs of Staff, shall provide for the administration and support of forces
assigned to each combatant command.

(b) RESPONSIBILITY OF SECRETARIES OF MILITARY DEPARTMENTS.—Subject to the
authority, direction, and control of the Secretary of Defense and subject to the authority of
commanders of the combatant commands under section 164(c) of this title, the Secretary of a
military department is responsible for the administration and support of forces assigned by him
to a combatant command.





(c) ASSIGNMENT OF RESPONSIBILITY TO OTHER COMPONENTS OF DOD.—After
consultation with the Secretaries of the military departments, the Secretary of Defense may
assign the responsibility (or any part of the responsibility) for the administration and support of
forces assigned to the combatant commands to other components of the Department of Defense
(including Defense Agencies and combatant commands). A component assigned such a
responsibility shall discharge that responsibility subject to the authority, direction, and control of
the Secretary of Defense and subject to the authority of commanders of the combatant commands
under section 164(c) of this title.

(d) ADVISORY BODIES THAT INCLUDE FOREIGN GOVERNMENT OR FOREIGN MILITARY
MEMBERS.—A committee or similar group that advises or assists the commander of a combatant
command, or that advises or assists a subordinate commander who is under the authority of the
commander of a combatant command, and that includes members who are full-time, or
permanent part-time, officers or employees of a foreign government or foreign armed force shall
not be considered to be an advisory committee under section 3(2) of the Federal Advisory
Committee Act (5 U.S.C. App.) solely because of such membership.







[

SEC. . PERMANENT AUTHORITY FOR ENROLLMENT IN DEFENSE
DEPENDENTS’” EDUCATION SYSTEM OF DEPENDENTS OF FOREIGN
MILITARY MEMBERS ASSIGNED TO SUPREME HEADQUARTERS
ALLIED POWERS, EUROPE.

(a) PERMANENT ENROLLMENT AUTHORITY.—Subsection (a)(2) of section 1404A of the
Defense Dependents’ Education Act of 1978 (20 U.S.C. 923a) is amended by striking “, and only
through the 2010-2011 school year”.

(b) CoMmBATANT COMMANDER ADVICE AND ASSISTANCE .—Subsection (c)(1) of such
section is amended by inserting after “Secretary” the following: *, with the advice and assistance
of the commander of the geographic combatant command with jurisdiction over Mons,

Belgium,”.

Section-by-Section Analysis

This proposal would make permanent the temporary authority provided to the Secretary
of Defense in section 571 of the John Warner National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2007 (Public Law 109-364) to enroll on a space-required, tuition-free basis a limited
number of dependents of foreign military members who are assigned to the Supreme
Headquarters Allied Powers Europe (SHAPE), in the Department of Defense dependents’
education system (DoDDS) in Mons, Belgium.

The proposal also would provide that the Secretary of Defense, in determining the
methodology for the proper number of foreign students, would do so with the advice and
assistance of the geographic combatant commander with jurisdiction over Mons, Belgium.

The proposal is necessary to improve and to add future predictability to one of the most
important interfaces between the United States military establishment and the partner nations in
our most important military alliance, the North Atlantic Treaty Organization (NATO).

Similarly, it is vital that the process for determining the number of foreign students
specifically include the advice and assistance of the relevant geographic combatant commander.
This provision -- not unlike the provisions including the “advice and assistance” of the Chairman
of the Joint Chiefs of Staff in certain military education matters (10 U.S.C. 8§ 2152(b) (National
Defense University curriculum) and 2154(a)(1) (Joint Professional Military Education)) -- would





emphasize the importance of the military and diplomatic issues associated with this unique
school.

Permitting these tuition-free enrollments is based on the judgment of the previous and
current Commanders, United States European Command, that it was an important diplomatic and
cultural tool. It is vital, in these times of challenges to the Alliance, that the United States do all
it can to reinforce its cultural ties with its neighbors.

BUDGET IMPLICATIONS

In the 2008-09 school year, there will be approximately 425 dependents of foreign military
members and civilian employees assigned to SHAPE enrolled in DoDDS at SHAPE Elementary
and SHAPE High School in Mons, Belgium. We expect that number to increase to 650 in the
2009-10 school year. For these purposes, we are assuming that the number of foreign students
will remain at 650 through the 2014-15 school year. Using an average tuition rate of $16,000,
and certain other marginal costs, the Department of Defense Education Activity (DoDEA)
estimates that implementation of this section would cost approximately $59.2 million from Fiscal
Year (FY) 2010 through FY 2015. There is an average tuition increase of $400 per pupil per
year. The cost estimate assumes that the DoD would continue to admit the same number of
students.

Under the current budget proposal, the DoDEA Operation and Maintenance account (Operation
and Maintenance, Defense-wide) has been approved for an increase of $59,200,000 during the
period FY2011-FY2015. (Deputy Secretary's FY 2010 to FY 2015 Program Decision
Memorandum I11 (Oct. 31, 2008) at Appendix I-21 (table 8)).

RESOURCE REQUIREMENTS (SMILLIONS)

FY FY FY FY FY FY | Appropriation | Budget Dash-1
2010 | 2011 | 2012 | 2013 | 2014 | 2015 From Activity Line Item

DODEA | 0.0 110 | 113 | 122 | 122 | 125 O&M, DW 04 4GTJ
0.0 11.0 | 113 | 122 | 122 | 125

Changes to Existing Law: This proposal would make the following changes to section 1404A
of the Defense Dependents’ Education Act of 1978 (20 U.S.C. 923a):

DEFENSE DEPENDENTS’ EDUCATION ACT OF 1978
(20 U.S.C. 923a)

ENROLLMENT OF CERTAIN ADDITIONAL CHILDREN ON TUITION-FREE BASIS

SEC. 1404A. (a) ENROLLMENT AUTHORIZED.—Under regulations to be prescribed by the
Secretary of Defense, the Secretary may authorize the enrollment in schools of the defense
dependents' education system on a tuition-free basis of—

(1) the children of full-time, locally-hired employees of the Department of

Defense in an overseas area if such employees are citizens or nationals of the United

States; and






(2) the children of a foreign military member assigned to the Supreme
Headquarters Allied Powers, Europe, but only in a school of the defense dependents'

education system in Mons, Belgium;-and-enly-through-the 2010-2011-school-year.
* * * * * * *

(c) SPECIAL RULES REGARDING ENROLLMENT OF DEPENDENTS OF FOREIGN MILITARY
MEMBERS ASSIGNED TO SUPREME HEADQUARTERS ALLIED POWERS, EUROPE.—(1) In the
regulations required by subsection (a), the Secretary, with the advice and assistance of the
commander of the geographic combatant command with jurisdiction over Mons, Belgium, shall
prescribe a methodology based on the estimated total number of dependents of sponsors under
section 1414(2) enrolled in schools of the defense dependents' education system in Mons,
Belgium, to determine the number of children described in paragraph (2) of subsection (a) who
will be authorized to enroll under such subsection.

* * * * * * *






