GENERAL COUNSEL OF THE DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE
1600 DEFENSE PENTAGON
WASHINGTON, D. C. 20301-1600

GENERAL COUNSEL

MAR 0 1 2007

The Honorable Richard B. Cheney
President of the Senate
Washington, D.C. 20510

Dear Mr. President:

The Department of Defense requests that the Congress enact the enclosed
legislative proposals as part of the National Defense Authorization Bill for Fiscal Year
2008.

The purpose of each proposal is stated in the accompanying section-by-section
analysis.

The Office of Management and Budget advises that there is no objection, from the
standpoint of the Administration's program, to the presenting of these legislative

proposals for your consideration and the consideration of the Congress.

Sincerely,

Wllllam J. Haynes

Enclosure:
As stated



GENERAL COUNSEL OF THE DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE
1600 DEFENSE PENTAGON
WASHINGTON, D. C. 20301-1600

GENERAL COUNSEL MAR 0 1 zm_{

The Honorable Nancy Pelosi
Speaker of the House of Representatives
Washington, D.C. 20515

Dear Madam Speaker:
The Department of Defense requests that the Congress enact the enclosed
legislative proposals as part of the National Defense Authorization Bill for Fiscal Year

2008.

The purpose of each proposal is stated in the accompanying section-by-section
analysis.

The Office of Management and Budget advises that there is no objection, from the
standpoint of the Administration's program, to the presenting of these legislative
proposals for your consideration and the consideration of the Congress.

Sincerely,
AL
William J. Haynes

Enclosure:
As stated



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

SEC. . ACCESSION BONUS FOR MEMBERS APPOINTED AS COMMISSIONED
OFFICERS AFTER ATTENDING OFFICER CANDIDATE SCHOOL.

(@) IN GENERAL.—Chapter 5 of title 37, United States Code, is amended by adding at the
end the following new section:

"8 331. Special pay: accession bonus for officer candidates

"(a) ACCESSION BoNus AUTHORIZED.—Under regulations prescribed by the Secretary
concerned, a person who executes a written agreement to complete officer candidate school,
accept a commission or appointment as an officer of the armed forces, and serve on active duty
as a commissioned officer for a period specified in the agreement may, upon acceptance of the
agreement by the Secretary concerned, be paid an accession bonus in an amount determined by
the Secretary.

"(b) LIMITATION ON AMOUNT OF BONUs.—The amount of an accession bonus under
subsection (a) may not exceed $8,000.

"(c) PAYMENT METHOD.—Upon acceptance of a written agreement under subsection (a)
by the Secretary concerned, the total amount of the accession bonus payable under the agreement
becomes fixed. The agreement shall specify whether the accession bonus will be paid by the
Secretary in a lump sum or installments.

"(d) REPAYMENT.—A person who, having received all or part of the bonus under an
agreement referred to in subsection (a), does not complete the total period of active duty service
as a commissioned officer as specified in the agreement shall be subject to the repayment
provisions in section 303a(e) of this title.

"(e) AUTHORITY FOR PAYMENT OF BONUS UNDER EARLIER AGREEMENTS.—The Secretary

of the Army shall use this authority to retroactively pay a bonus to a person who executed an



agreement during the period from April 1, 2005 through April 1, 2006 to enlist for the purpose of
attending officer candidate school.".
(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sections at the beginning of such chapter is

amended by adding at the end the following new item:

"330. Special pay: accession bonus for officer candidates.".

Section-by-Section Analysis

This section would authorize the payment of a bonus to a person who agrees to complete
officer candidate school, accept a commission or appointment as an officer of the armed forces,
and serve on active duty as a commissioned officer for a period specified by the Secretary
concerned. The Secretary concerned would determine the amount of the bonus, not to exceed
$8,000. A person who does not serve on active duty as a commissioned officer for the period
specified would be subject to the repayment provisions applicable to similar bonuses under title
37.

Subsection (e) of new section 331 of title 37, United States Code, would require the
Secretary of the Army to use this authority to retroactively pay a bonus to a person who entered
into an agreement during the period from April 1, 2005 through April 1, 2006 to attend officer
candidate school and receive a bonus, but has not yet received the bonus, notwithstanding the
person's completion of the conditions of the agreement. Section 309 of title 37 authorizes an
enlistment bonus for persons who serve on active duty for at least two years; this authority is
used to enlist persons to serve in critical skills. Subsection (e) of new section 331 would clarify
that these earlier agreements to attend officer candidate school and receive a bonus under section
309 are retroactively authorized.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

SEC. . FLEXIBLE FINANCING OF MILITARY HOUSING PRIVATIZATION
INITIATIVE.
Section 2883 of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in subsection (c)—
(A) in paragraph (1)(D)—
(i) by striking "interest on loans made under section 2873 of this
title,";
(ii) by striking "and any" and inserting "any"; and
(iii) by inserting before the period at the end the following: ", and
excluding amounts from any transactions pursuant to loans made under
section 2873 of this title"; and
(B) in paragraph (2)(D)—
(i) by striking "interest on loans made under section 2873 of this
title,";
(i) by striking "and any" and inserting "any"; and
(iii) by inserting before the period at the end the following: ", and
excluding amounts from any transactions pursuant to loans made under
section 2873 of this title"; and
(2) by adding at the end of subsection (d) the following new paragraph:
"(4) Notwithstanding paragraphs (1) and (2), the Secretary of Defense may use
amounts credited to the Funds under paragraphs (1)(C), (1)(D), (2)(C), and (2)(D) in

subsection (c) without appropriation. The Secretary may use such funds only after—



"(A) the end of the 30-day period beginning on the date the Secretary
submits written notice of, and justification for, the use of such amounts to the
appropriate committees of Congress; or

"(B) if earlier, the end of the 14-day period beginning on the date on
which a copy of the notice and justification is provided in an electronic medium

pursuant to section 480 of this title.".

Section-by-Section Analysis

Section 2883(c) of title 10, United States Code, allows funds to be credited to the
Department of Defense (DoD) Family Housing Improvement Fund (FHIF), including:

(1) amounts authorized and appropriated to the Fund;

(2) amounts that the Secretary of Defense transfers in such amounts as provided in
appropriations Acts to the Fund from amounts appropriated to the DoD for the acquisition or
construction of military family housing;

(3) proceed from the conveyance or lease of property or facilities under section 2878 of
title 10; and

(4) income and gains realized from investments under section 2875 of title 10.

Section 2883(d) limits the funds that can be expended from the account to such amounts
as provided in appropriation acts. This proposed amendment would permit the Military
Departments to retain the income and gains received through projects previously executed via
the FHIF and spend those funds on future privatization projects without having to have the funds
appropriated. To abide by credit reform rules, this amendment would exclude the use of
cashflows and transactions associated with loans made under section 2873 of title 10.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

SEC. . ONE-YEAR EXTENSION OF AUTHORITIES RELATING TO PAYMENT
OF OTHER BONUSES AND SPECIAL PAYS.

(a) AVIATION OFFICER RETENTION BONUS.—Section 301b(a) of title 37, United States
Code, is amended by striking "December 31, 2007" and inserting "December 31, 2008".

(b) ASSIGNMENT INCENTIVE PAY.—Section 307a(g) of such title is amended by striking
"December 31, 2008" and inserting "December 31, 2009".

(c) REENLISTMENT BONUS FOR ACTIVE MEMBERS.—Section 308(g) of such title is
amended by striking "December 31, 2007" and inserting "December 31, 2008".

(d) ENLISTMENT BoNus.—Section 309(e) of such title is amended by striking "December
31, 2007 and inserting "December 31, 2008".

(e) RETENTION INCENTIVES FOR MEMBERS QUALIFIED IN CRITICAL MILITARY SKILLS OR
ASSIGNED TO HIGH PRIORITY UNITS.—Section 323(i) of such title is amended by striking
"December 31, 2007" and inserting "December 31, 2008".

(F) AccessioN BoNus FOR NEW OFFICERS IN CRITICAL SKILLS.—Section 324(g) of such
title is amended by striking "December 31, 2007" and inserting "December 31, 2008".

(g) INCENTIVE BONUS FOR CONVERSION TO MILITARY OCCUPATIONAL SPECIALTY TO
EASE PERSONNEL SHORTAGE.—Section 326(g) of such title is amended by striking "December
31, 2007 and inserting "December 31, 2008".

(h) AccessION BoNUS FOR MEMBERS OF THE ARMED FORCES APPOINTED AS
CoMMISSIONED OFFICERS AFTER COMPLETING OFFICER CANDIDATE ScHooL.—Section 330(f) of

such title is amended by striking "December 31, 2007" and inserting "December 31, 2008".

Section-by-Section Analysis



This section would extend for one year, through December 31, 2008, accession,
conversion, and retention bonuses for military personnel possessing or acquiring critical skills or
assigned to high priority units, including occupations that are arduous or that feature extremely
high training and replacement costs. It also would extend incentive pay for members in
designated assignments and the authority for payment of an accession bonus upon commission
following completion of officer candidate school. Experience shows that retention of members
in critical skills would be unacceptably low without these incentives, which in turn would
generate the substantially greater costs associated with recruiting and developing replacements.
The Department of Defense and the Congress have long recognized the cost-effectiveness of
financial incentives in supporting effective staffing in such critical military skills, assignments,
and high priority units.

Cost Implications: There are no additional costs associated with this section. The military
departments have already projected expenditures for these incentives in their budget sections.



SEC. . REVISED AUTHORITY FOR ARMY INDUSTRIAL FACILITIES TO
ENGAGE IN COOPERATIVE ACTIVITIES WITH NON-ARMY
ENTITIES.
Section 4544 of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in subsection (a), by adding at the end the following new sentence: "The Army
is authorized not more than eight contracts or cooperative arrangements in total under this
section.”; and

(2) by striking subsection (k).

Section-by-Section Analysis

Section 4544 of title 10, United States Code, authorizes any working-capital funded
Army industrial facility (including an ammunition plant, arsenal, depot, or manufacturing plant)
to enter into a contract or cooperative arrangement with a non-Army entity to carry out with the
non-Army entity specified military or commercial projects. These projects include the sale of
articles manufactured by the facility or services performed by the facility to persons outside the
Department of the Army; performance of work by a non-Army entity at the facility; performance
of work by the facility for a non-Army entity; sharing of work by the facility and non-Army
entity; leasing, or use under a facilities use contract or otherwise, of the facility or equipment of
the facility by a non-Army entity; and the preparation and submission of joint offers by the
facility and the non-Army entity for competitive procurements entered into with a Federal
agency.

Subsection (c) of section 4544 places certain conditions on activities under the section;
for example, an activity may not interfere with the performance of work by the facility for the
Department of Defense.

The proceeds received from the sale of an article or service pursuant to a contract or
cooperative arrangement under the section are credited to the working capital fund that incurs the
cost of manufacturing the article or performing the service.

The authority under section 4544 will expire on September 30, 2009. This amendment
would eliminate the time restriction. This would enable the Army to enter into long-term
partnerships or agreements that are in the best interest of the Government. This also would
provide for a more efficient and economical use of Government-owned industrial plants while
encouraging the creation and preservation of jobs. In addition, this amendment would limit to



eight the number of contracts or other cooperative arrangements under section 4544.



SEC. . EXPANSION OF AUTHORITY TO EXCHANGE RESERVE COMPONENT
FACILITIES.
Section 18240(a) of title 10, United States Code is amended by striking "with a State™ in
the first sentence and inserting "with an executive agency as that term is defined in section 105

of title 5, the United States Postal Service, a State".

Section-by-Section Analysis

A number of reserve component facilities are no longer in the ideal location for their
military mission due to surrounding land development and encroachment, but are still required
by the Army to meet mission requirements. This legislation would authorize the Secretary of
Defense to authorize the Secretary of a military department to exchange such non-excess, reserve
component real property and facilities for replacement real property and facilities of equal fair
market value.

Section 18240 of title 10, United States Code, was enacted in the Ronald W. Reagan
National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2005 (Public Law 108-375) as the result of
an Army-initiated legislative proposal. Its authority has proven to be an important tool in
helping the reserve components obtain new replacement facilities and real property in locations
better suited for military operations and training.

As currently drafted, section 18240 authorizes an exchange of non-excess reserve
component facilities under the control of that Secretary through "an agreement with a State, local
government, local authority, or private entity." The Army and the General Services
Administration recently determined that, in its current form, section 18240 does not authorize an
exchange of non-excess reserve component facilities with another Federal agency or
organization of the Federal government such as the United States Postal Service (USPS). This
problem became evident after the USPS expressed interest in acquiring an Army Reserve facility
in Boston, Massachusetts specifically under section 18240. While there is other authority under
which to exchange excess property between agencies, no other authority exists under which an
exchange of these non-excess Department of Defense facilities with Federal agencies and
Federal organizations could occur.

Federal agencies should be eligible exchange entities under section 18240. This
proposed section would resolve the gap in the underlying authority by authorizing exchanges
between military departments and other organizations of the United States Government.



DIVISION B—MILITARY CONSTRUCTION AUTHORIZATIONS

Sec. 2001. Short title.
TITLE XXI—ARMY

Sec. 2101. Authorized Army construction and land acquisition projects.

Sec. 2102. Family housing.

Sec. 2103. Improvements to military family housing units.

Sec. 2104. Authorization of appropriations, Army.

Sec. 2105. Modification of authority to carry out certain fiscal year 2006 projects.

TITLE XXII—NAVY
Sec. 2201. Authorized Navy construction and land acquisition projects.
Sec. 2202. Family housing.
Sec. 2203. Improvements to military family housing units.
Sec. 2204. Authorization of appropriations, Navy.
TITLE XXIII—AIR FORCE
Sec. 2301. Authorized Air Force construction and land acquisition projects.
Sec. 2302. Family housing.
Sec. 2303. Improvements to military family housing units.
Sec. 2304. Authorization of appropriations, Air Force.
Sec. 2305. Modification of authority to carry out certain fiscal year 2006 project.
TITLE XXIV—DEFENSE AGENCIES
Sec. 2401. Authorized Defense Agencies construction and land acquisition projects.
Sec. 2402. Energy conservation projects.
Sec. 2403. Authorized base closure and realignment activities funded through Department of Defense Base Closure
Account 2005.
Sec. 2404. Authorization of appropriations, Defense Agencies.
TITLE XXV—NORTH ATLANTIC TREATY ORGANIZATION SECURITY INVESTMENT PROGRAM

Sec. 2501. Authorized NATO construction and land acquisition projects.
Sec. 2502. Authorization of appropriations, NATO.

TITLE XXVI—CHEMICAL DEMILITARIZATION PROGRAM
Sec. 2601. Authorization of appropriations, chemical demilitarization construction, defense-wide.
TITLE XXVII—GUARD AND RESERVE FORCES FACILITIES
Sec. 2701. Authorized Guard and Reserve construction and land acquisition projects.
TITLE XXVIII—EXPIRATION AND EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS
Sec. 2801. Expiration of authorizations and amounts required to be specified by law.

Sec. 2802. Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2005 projects.
Sec. 2803. Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2004 projects.



10

11

12

XXIX—GENERAL PROVISIONS

[Previously transmitted to Congress]

DIVISION B—MILITARY CONSTRUCTION

AUTHORIZATIONS

SECTION 2001. SHORT TITLE.
This division may be cited as the "Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal

Year 2008".
TITLE XXI—ARMY

SEC. 2101. AUTHORIZED ARMY CONSTRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION
PROJECTS.

(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2104(a)(1), the Secretary of the Army may acquire real
property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations inside the
United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Army: Inside the United States

State Installation or Location Amount
Alabama Anniston Army Depot 26,000,000
Alaska Fort Wainwright 74,000,000
Arizona Fort Huachuca 11,000,000
California Fort Irwin 24,000,000

Presidio, Monterey 28,000,000
Colorado Fort Carson 14,200,000
Delaware Dover Air Force Base 17,500,000
Florida Eglin Air Force Base 66,000,000
Miami Doral 237,000,000
Georgia Fort Benning 185,800,000
Fort Stewart/Hunter Army Air Field 62,000,000
Hawaii Fort Shafter 31,000,000
Schofield Barracks 88,000,000




Wheeler Army Air Field 51,000,000
Kansas Fort Leavenworth 55,000,000
Fort Riley 28,000,000
Kentucky Fort Campbell 54,000,000
Fort Knox 6,700,000
Missouri Fort Leonard Wood 7,800,000
Nevada Hawthorne Army Ammunition Plant 11,800,000
New York Fort Drum 151,000,000
North Carolina Fort Bragg 55,800,000
Oklahoma Fort Sill 2,900,000
Texas Camp Bullis 1,600,000
Fort Hood 47,000,000
Fort Sam Houston 1,950,000
Red River Army Depot 9,200,000
Virginia Fort Belvoir 13,000,000
Washington Fort Lewis 5,000,000
Yakima Training Center 29,000,000
Total 1,395,250,000

(b) OuTsIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2104(a)(2), the Secretary of the Army may acquire real

property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations outside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Army: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
Afghanistan Afghanistan 13,800,000
Bulgaria Nevo Selo FOS 61,000,000
Germany Grafenwoehr 62,000,000
Honduras Honduras Various Locations 2,550,000
Italy Vicenza 173,000,000
Korea Camp Humphreys 57,000,000
Romania Romania Various Locations 12,600,000

Total 381,950,000

(c) UNsPECIFIED WORLDWIDE.—Using the amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2104(a)(3), the Secretary of the Army may acquire real
property and carry out military construction projects for unspecified installations or locations in

the amount set forth in the following table:




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

Army: Unspecified Worldwide

Location Installation or Location Amount
Unspecified Worldwide Grow the Force 1,608,129,000
Total 1,608,129,000

SEC. 2102. FAMILY HOUSING.

(a) CONSTRUCTION AND ACQUISITION.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2104(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Army may
construct or acquire family housing units (including land acquisition and supporting facilities) at

the installations or locations, in the number of units, and in the amounts set forth in the following

table:
Army: Family Housin
Country Installation or Location Purpose Amount
Germany Ansbach 138 Units 52,000,000
Total 52,000,000

(b) PLANNING AND DESIGN.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization
of appropriations in section 2104(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Army may carry out architectural
and engineering services and construction design activities with respect to the construction or
improvement of family housing units in an amount not to exceed $2,000,000.

SEC. 2103. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING UNITS.

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States Code, and using amounts appropriated
pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section 2104(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the
Army may improve existing military family housing units in an amount not to exceed
$365,400,000.

SEC. 2104. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, ARMY.
(a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Funds are hereby authorized to be

appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for military construction, land




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

acquisition, and military family housing functions of the Department of the Army in the total
amount of $5,201,517,000 as follows:
(1) For military construction projects inside the United States authorized by
section 2101(a), $1,395,250,000.
(2) For military construction projects outside the United States authorized by
section 2101(b), $381,950,000.
(3) For military construction projects at unspecified worldwide locations
authorized by section 2101(c), $1,608,129,000.
(4) For unspecified minor military construction projects authorized by section
2805 of title 10, United States Code, $23,000,000.
(5) For architectural and engineering services and construction design under
section 2807 of title 10, United States Code, $481,468,000.
(6) For military family housing functions:
(A) For construction and acquisition, planning and design, and
improvement of military family housing and facilities, $419,400,000.
(B) For support of military family housing (including the functions
described in section 2833 of title 10, United States Code), $742,920,000.
(7) For the construction of increment 3 of a barracks complex at Fort Bragg,
North Carolina, authorized by section 2101(a) of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3485),
$47,400,000.

(8) For the construction of increment 2 of a barracks complex at Fort Lewis,



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

Washington, authorized by section 2101(a) of the Military Construction Authorization

Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2445),

$102,000,000.

(b) LIMITATION ON TOTAL COSsT OF CONSTRUCTION PROJECTS.—Notwithstanding the cost
variations authorized by section 2853 of title 10, United States Code, or any other cost variation
authorized by law, the total cost of all projects carried out under section 2101 of this Act may not
exceed the sum of the following:

(1) The total amount authorized to be appropriated under paragraphs (1), (2), and

(3) of subsection (a).

(2) $204,000,000 (the balance of the amount authorized under section 2101(a) for
construction of a brigade complex for Fort Lewis, Washington).
SEC. 2105. MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT CERTAIN FISCAL
YEAR 2006 PROJECTS.

(a) MoDIFICATION.—The table in section 2101(a) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3485) is
amended in the item relating to Fort Bragg, North Carolina, by striking "$301,250,000" in the
amount column and inserting "$308,250,000".

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 2104(b)(5) of that Act (119 Stat. 3488) is
amended by striking "$77,400,000" and inserting "$84,400,000".

TITLE XXII—NAVY

SEC. 2201. AUTHORIZED NAVY CONSTRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION

PROJECTS.



[N

(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2204(a)(1), the Secretary of the Navy may acquire real

property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations inside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Navy: Inside the United States

State Installation or Location Amount
Alabama Outlying Field Evergreen 9,560,000
Arizona Marine Corps Air Station, Yuma 33,720,000
California Marine Corps Base, Camp Pendleton 166,150,000

Naval Station, San Diego 23,630,000
Marine Corps Base, Twentynine Palms 34,329,000
Florida Marine Corps Logistics Base, Blount Island (Jacksonville) 7,570,000
Naval Surface Warfare Center, Coastal Systems Station, 13,870,000
Panama City
Hawaii Marine Corps Air Station, Kaneohe 37,961,000
Naval Base, Pearl Harbor 99,860,000
Naval Station Pearl Harbor, Wahiawa 65,410,000
Ilinois Naval Training Center, Great Lakes 10,221,000
Maryland Naval Air Warfare Center, Patuxent River 38,360,000
North Carolina Marine Corps Air Station, Cherry Point 28,610,000
Marine Corps Air Station, New River 54,430,000
Marine Corps Base, Camp Lejeune 154,390,000
South Carolina Marine Corps Air Station, Beaufort 6,800,000
Marine Corps Recruit Depot, Parris Island 30,852,000
Texas Naval Air Station, Corpus Christi 14,290,000
Virginia Naval Support Activity, Chesapeake 8,450,000
Naval Station, Norfolk 65,360,000
Marine Corps Base Quantico 45,519,000
Washington Bremerton 119,760,000
Naval Air Station, Whidbey Island 23,910,000
Total 1,093,012,000

(b) OuTsIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2204(a)(2), the Secretary of the Navy may acquire real

property and carry out military construction projects for the installation or location outside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Navy: Outside the United States

Country

| Installation or Location

Amount




-

10

11

12

13

14

Bahrain Southwest Asia 35,500,000
Diego Garcia Naval Support Facility, Diego Garcia 7,150,000
Djibouti Camp Lemonier 22,390,000
Guam Naval Activities, Guam 278,818,000

Total 343,858,000

(c) UNsPECIFIED WORLDWIDE.—Using the amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2204(a)(3), the Secretary of the Navy may acquire real
property and carry out military construction projects for unspecified installations or locations in
the amounts set forth in the following table:

Navy: Unspecified Worldwide

Location Installation or Location Amount
Worldwide Unspecified Wharf Utilities Upgrade 8,900,000
Growing the Force 361,120,000
Host Nation Infrastructure 2,700,000
Total 372,720,000
SEC. 2202. FAMILY HOUSING.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section
2204(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Navy may construct or acquire family housing units
(including land acquisition and supporting facilities) at the installations or locations, in the
number of units, and in the amount set forth in the following table:

Navy: Family Housing
State Installation or Location Purpose Amount
Mariana Islands Naval Activities, Guam 73 Units 57,167,000
Total 57,167,000

(b) PLANNING AND DESIGN.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization
of appropriations in section 2204(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Navy may carry out architectural
and engineering services and construction design activities with respect to the construction or
improvement of family housing units in an amount not to exceed $3,172,000.

SEC. 2203. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING UNITS.




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States Code, and using amounts appropriated
pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section 2204(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the
Navy may improve existing military family housing units in an amount not to exceed
$237,990,000.

SEC. 2204. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, NAVY.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2007, for military construction, land acquisition, and military family housing functions of the
Department of the Navy in the total amount of $2,774,009,000, as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the United States authorized by
section 2201(a), $1,093,012,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside the United States authorized by
section 2201(b), $343,858,000.

(3) For military construction projects at unspecified worldwide locations
authorized by section 2201(c), $372,720,000.

(4) For unspecified minor military construction projects authorized by section

2805 of title 10, United States Code, $10,000,000.

(5) For architectural and engineering services and construction design under
section 2807 of title 10, United States Code, $110,167,000.
(6) For military family housing functions:
(A) For construction and acquisition, planning and design, and
improvement of military family housing and facilities, $298,329,000.

(B) For support of military family housing (including functions described



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

in section 2833 of title 10, United States Code), $371,404,000.

(7) For the construction of increment 2 of the National Maritime Intelligence
Center, Suitland, Maryland, authorized by section 2201(a) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat.
2448), $52,069,000.

(8) For the construction of increment 3 of recruit training barracks infrastructure
upgrade at Recruit Training Command, Great Lakes, Illinois, authorized by section
2201(a) of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B
of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3490), $16,650,000.

(9) For the construction of the next increment of wharf upgrades at Yokosuka,
Japan, authorized by section 2201(b) of the Military Construction Authorization Act of
Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3490), $8,750,000.

(10) For the construction of increment 2 of the Bachelor Enlisted Quarters
Homeport Ashore Program at Bremerton, Washington, authorized by section 2201(a) of
the Military Construction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public
Law 109-163; 119 Stat.3490), $47,240,000.

(11) For the construction of the next increment of the outlaying landing field
facilities at Washington County, North Carolina, authorized by section 2201(a) of the
Military Construction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2005 (division B of Public Law
108-375; 118 Stat. 2101), $10,060,000.

(12) For the construction of increment 4 of the limited area production and

storage complex at Naval Submarine Base, Kitsap, Bangor, Washington, authorized by



N

10

section 2201(a) of the Military Construction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2005

(division B of Public Law 108-375; 118 Stat. 2106), $39,750,000.

TITLE XXII1—AIR FORCE

SEC. 2301. AUTHORIZED AIR FORCE CONSTRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION

PROJECTS.

(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2304(a)(1), the Secretary of the Air Force may acquire

real property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations inside

the United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Air Force: Inside the United States

State Installation or Location Amount

Alaska Elmendorf Air Force Base 70,180,000
Arizona Davis-Monthan Air Force Base 11,200,000
California Travis Air Force Base 26,600,000
Colorado Fort Carson 13,500,000

Schriever Air Force Base 24,500,000

United States Air Force Academy 15,000,000
District of Columbia Bolling Air Force Base 2,500,000
Florida Eglin Air Force Base 158,300,000

MacDill Air Force Base 57,000,000

Patrick Air Force Base 11,854,000

Tyndall Air Force Base 44,114,000
Georgia Robins Air Force Base 14,700,000
Hawaii Hickam Air Force Base 31,971,000
Illinois Scott Air Force Base 16,700,000
Kansas Fort Riley 12,515,000
Nebraska Offutt Air Force Base 16,952,000
New Mexico Cannon Air Force Base 1,688,000
North Dakota Minot Air Force Base 18,200,000
Oklahoma Altus Air Force Base 2,000,000

Tinker Air Force Base 34,600,000
Texas Lackland Air Force Base 14,000,000
Utah Hill Air Force Base 16,799,000
Wyoming Francis E. Warren Air Force Base 14,600,000

Total 629,473,000

(b) OuTsIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the




10

11

12

authorization of appropriations in section 2304(a)(2), the Secretary of the Air Force may acquire
real property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations outside
the United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Air Force: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
Germany Ramstein Air Base 48,209,000
Guam Andersen Air Force Base 10,000,000
Qatar Al Udeid Air Base 22,300,000
Spain Moron Air Base 1,800,000
United Kingdom Royal Air Force Lakenheath 17,300,000

Royal Air Force Menwith Hill Station 41,000,000
Total 140,609,000

(c) UNsPECIFIED WORLDWIDE.—Using the amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2304(a)(3), the Secretary of the Air Force may acquire
real property and carry out military construction projects for unspecified installations or locations
in the amounts set forth in the following table:

Air Force: Unspecified Worldwide

Location Installation or Location Amount
Worldwide Classified Classified Project 1,500,000
Classified — Special Evaluation Program 13,940,000
Total 15,440,000

SEC. 2302. FAMILY HOUSING.

(a) CONSTRUCTION AND ACQUISITION.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2304(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Air Force may
construct or acquire family housing units (including land acquisition and supporting facilities) at
the installations, in the number of units, and in the amounts set forth in the following table:

Air Force: Family Housing

State Installation or Location Purpose Amount

Germany Ramstein Air Base 117 Units | 56,275,000

Total 56,275,000




-

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(b) PLANNING AND DESIGN.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization
of appropriations in section 2304(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Air Force may carry out
architectural and engineering services and construction design activities with respect to the
construction or improvement of family housing units in an amount not to exceed $12,210,000.
SEC. 2303. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING UNITS.

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States Code, and using amounts appropriated
pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section 2304(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Air
Force may improve existing military family housing units in an amount not to exceed
$294,262,000.

SEC. 2304. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, AIR FORCE.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2007, for military construction, land acquisition, and military family housing functions of the
Department of the Air Force in the total amount of $1,963,191,000, as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the United States authorized by
section 2301(a), $629,473,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside the United States authorized by
section 2301(b), $140,609,000.

(3) For the military construction projects at unspecified worldwide locations
authorized by section 2301(c), $15,440,000.

(4) For unspecified minor military construction projects authorized by section

2805 of title 10, United States Code, $15,000,000.

(5) For architectural and engineering services and construction design under



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

section 2807 of title 10, United States Code, $51,587,000.
(6) For military family housing functions:
(A) For construction and acquisition, planning and design, and
improvement of military family housing and facilities, $362,747,000.
(B) For support of military family housing (including functions described
in section 2833 of title 10, United States Code), $688,335,000.
(7) For the construction of phase 3 of the main base runway at Edwards Air Force
Base, California, authorized by section 2301(a) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3494), $35,000,000.
(8) For the construction of phase 3 of the CENTCOM Joint Intelligence Center at
MacDill Air Force Base, Florida, authorized by section 2301(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163;

119 Stat. 3494), $25,000,000.

SEC. 2305. MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT CERTAIN FISCAL

YEAR 2006 PROJECT.

The table in section 2301(a) of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal

Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3494), as amended by section 2305(a)
of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law
109-364; 120 Stat. 2456), is further amended by striking "$101,500,000" in the amount column

and inserting "$126,500,000".

TITLE XXIV—DEFENSE AGENCIES



SEC. 2401. AUTHORIZED DEFENSE AGENCIES CONSTRUCTION AND LAND

ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2404(a)(1), the Secretary of Defense may acquire real

property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations inside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Defense Agencies: Inside the United States

Agency Installation or Location Amount
Defense Education Activity Marine Corps Base, Camp Lejeune, North Carolina 2,014,000
Defense Intelligence Agency Bolling Air Force Base, District of Columbia 1,012,000
Defense Logistics Agency Point Loma Annex, California 140,000,000
Naval Air Station, Key West, Florida 1,874,000
Hickam Air Force Base, Hawaii 26,000,000
Kirtland Air Force Base, New Mexico 1,800,000
Defense Supply Center Columbus, Ohio 4,000,000
Defense Distribution Depot, New Cumberland, 21,000,000
Pennsylvania
Fort Belvoir, Virginia 5,000,000
National Security Agency Fort Meade, Maryland 11,901,000
Special Operations Command Marine Corps Base, Camp Pendleton, California 20,030,000
Naval Amphibious Base, Coronado, California 12,000,000
Hurlburt Field, Florida 29,111,000
MacDill Air Force Base, Florida 47,700,000
Fort Benning, Georgia 35,000,000
Hunter Army Air Field, Georgia 13,800,000
Fort Campbell, Kentucky 53,500,000
Cannon Air Force Base, New Mexico 7,500,000
Fort Bragg, North Carolina 47,250,000
Marine Corps Base, Camp Lejeune, North Carolina 28,210,000
Dam Neck, Virginia 108,500,000
Naval Amphibious Base, Little Creek, Virginia 99,000,000
Fort Lewis, Washington 77,000,000
Tri-Care Management Activity MacDill Air Force Base, Florida 5,000,000
Naval Hospital Great Lakes, Illinois 99,000,000
Fort Drum, New York 41,000,000
Camp Bullis, Texas 7,400,000
Naval Station, Norfolk, Virginia 6,450,000
Fort Lewis, Washington 21,000,000
Washington Headquarters Services | Pentagon Reservation 18,531,000
Total 991,583,000




[N

10

11

12

13

14

15

(b) OuTsIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2404(a)(2), the Secretary of Defense may acquire real

property and carry out military construction projects for the installations or locations outside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Defense Agencies: Outside the United States

Agency Installation or Location Amount
Defense Education Activity Sterrebeek, Belgium 5,992,000
Ramstein Air Base, Germany 5,393,000
Wiesbaden Air Base, Germany 20,472,000
Special Operations Command Southwest Asia, Bahrain 19,000,000
Qatar 52,852,000
Tri-Care Management Activity Spangdahlem Air Base, Germany 30,100,000
Total 133,809,000

(c) UNsPECIFIED WORLDWIDE.—Using the amounts appropriated pursuant to the

authorization of appropriations in section 2404(a)(3), the Secretary of Defense may acquire real

property and carry out military construction projects for unspecified installations or locations in

the amount set forth in the following table:

Defense Agencies: Unspecified Worldwide

Location Installation or Location Amount
Worldwide Classified Classified Project 1,887,000
Total 1,887,000

SEC. 2402. ENERGY CONSERVATION PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section

2403(a)(6), the Secretary of Defense may carry out energy conservation projects under chapter

173 of title 10, United States Code, in the amount of $70,000,000.

SEC. 2403. AUTHORIZED BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVITIES

FUNDED THROUGH DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE BASE CLOSURE

ACCOUNT 2005.




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in section
2404(a)(9), the Secretary of Defense may carry out base closure and realignment activities,
including real property acquisition and military construction projects, as authorized by the
Defense Base Closure and Realignment Act of 1990 (part A of title XXIX of Public Law 101-
510; 10 U.S.C. 2687 note) and funded through the Department of Defense Base Closure Account
2005 established by section 2906A of such Act, in the amount of $10,703,059,000.

SEC. 2404. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, DEFENSE AGENCIES.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2007, for military construction, land acquisition, and military family housing functions of the
Department of Defense (other than the military departments) in the total amount of
$10,243,688,000, as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the United States authorized by
section 2401(a), $977,483,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside the United States authorized by
section 2401(b), $133,809,000.

(3) For the military construction projects at unspecified worldwide locations
authorized by section 2301(c), $1,887,000.

(4) For unspecified minor military construction projects under section 2805 of
title 10, United States Code, $23,711,000.

(5) For contingency construction projects of the Secretary of Defense under
section 2804 of title 10, United States Code, $10,000,000.

(6) For architectural and engineering services and construction design under



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

section 2807 of title 10, United States Code, $154,728,000.

(7) For Energy Conservation projects authorized by section 2402 of this Act,
$70,000,000.

(8) For base closure and realignment activities as authorized by the Defense Base
Closure and Realignment Act of 1990 (part A of title XXI1X of Public Law 101-510; 10
U.S.C. 2687 note) and funded through the Department of Defense Base Closure Account
1990 established by section 2906 of such Act, $220,689,000.

(9) For base closure and realignment activities authorized by section 2403 of this
Act and funded through the Department of Defense Base Closure Account 2005
established by section 2906A of the Defense Base Closure and Realignment Act of 1990
(part A of title XXIX of Public Law 101-510; 10 U.S.C. 2687 note), $8,174,315,000.

(10) For military family housing functions:

(A) For support of military family housing (including functions described
in section 2833 of title 10, United States Code), $48,848,000.
(B) For credit to the Department of Defense Family Housing Improvement

Fund established by section 2883(a)(1) of title 10, United States Code, $500,000.

(11) For the construction of increment 3 of the NSA/CSS Hawaii replacement at
Kunia, Hawaii, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Construction Authorization
Act of Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3497), as amended
by section 7017 of the Emergency Supplemental Appropriation Act for Defense, Global
War on Terrorism and Hurricane Relief (Public Law 109-234; 120 Stat. 485),

$136,318,000.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(12) For the construction of increment 3 of the NSA/CSS replacement at Augusta,
Georgia, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Construction Authorization Act of
Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3497), as amended by
section 7016 of the Emergency Supplemental Appropriation Act for Defense, Global War
on Terrorism and Hurricane Relief (Public Law 109-234; 120 Stat. 485), $100,000,000.

(13) For the construction of increment 2 of the clinic replacement at MacDill Air
Force Base, Florida, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat.
2457), $41,400,000.

(14) For the construction of increment 2 of the USAMRIID Stage 1 at Fort
Detrick, Maryland, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Construction
Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat.

2457), $150,000,000.

TITLE XXV—NORTH ATLANTIC TREATY ORGANIZATION

SECURITY INVESTMENT PROGRAM

SEC. 2501. AUTHORIZED NATO CONSTRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION
PROJECTS.

The Secretary of Defense may make contributions for the North Atlantic Treaty
Organization Security Investment Program as provided in section 2806 of title 10, United States
Code, in an amount not to exceed the sum of the amount authorized to be appropriated for this
purpose in section 2502 and the amount collected from the North Atlantic Treaty Organization as

a result of construction previously financed by the United States.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

SEC. 2502. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, NATO.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2007, for contributions by the Secretary of Defense under section 2806 of title 10, United
States Code, for the share of the United States of the cost of projects for the North Atlantic
Treaty Organization Security Investment Program authorized by section 2501, in the amount of

$201,400,000.
TITLE XXVI—CHEMICAL DEMILITARIZATION PROGRAM

SEC. 2601. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, CHEMICAL
DEMILITARIZATION CONSTRUCTION, DEFENSE-WIDE.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2007, for military construction and land acquisition for Chemical Demilitarization in the total
amount of $86,176,000, as follows:
(1) For the construction of phase 9 of a munitions demilitarization facility at
Pueblo Chemical Activity, Colorado, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 1997 (division B of Public Law 104-201;
110 Stat. 2775), as amended by section 2406 of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2000 (division B of Public Law 106-65; 113 Stat. 839), and section
2407 of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2003 (division B of
Public Law 107-314; 116 Stat. 2699), $35,159,000.
(2) For the construction of phase 8 of a munitions demilitarization facility at Blue
Grass Army Depot, Kentucky, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2000 (division B of Public Law 106-65; 113 Stat. 835),



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

as amended by section 2405 of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2002 (division B of Public Law 107-107; 115 Stat. 1298), and section 2405 of the
Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2003 (division B of Public Law

107-314; 116 Stat. 2698), $51,017,000.
TITLE XXVII—GUARD AND RESERVE FORCES FACILITIES

SEC. 2701. AUTHORIZED GUARD AND RESERVE CONSTRUCTION AND LAND
ACQUISITION PROJECTS.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years beginning after September
30, 2007, for the costs of acquisition, architectural and engineering services, and construction of
facilities for the reserve components, and for contributions therefore, under chapter 1803 of title
10, United States Code (including the cost of acquisition of land for those facilities), in the
following amounts:
(1) For the Department of the Army—
(A) for the Army National Guard of the United States, $404,291,000; and
(B) for the Army Reserve, $119,684,000.
(2) For the Department of the Navy, for the Navy Reserve and Marine Corps
Reserve, $59,150,000.
(3) For the Department of the Air Force—
(A) for the Air National Guard of the United States, $85,517,000; and

(B) for the Air Force Reserve, $26,559,000.

TITLE XXVIII—EXPIRATION AND EXTENSION OF

AUTHORIZATIONS



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

SEC. 2801. EXPIRATION OF AUTHORIZATIONS AND AMOUNTS REQUIRED TO
BE SPECIFIED BY LAW.

(a) EXPIRATION OF AUTHORIZATIONS AFTER THREE YEARS.—EXcept as provided in
subsection (b), all authorizations contained in titles XXI through XXVII for military construction
projects, land acquisition, family housing projects and facilities, and contributions to the North
Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Investment Program (and authorizations of appropriations
therefore) shall expire on the later of—

(1) October 1, 2010; or
(2) the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing funds for military construction

for fiscal year 2011.

(b) ExcepTION.—Subsection (a) shall not apply to authorizations for military
construction projects, land acquisition, family housing projects and facilities, and contributions
to the North Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Investment Program (and authorizations of
appropriations therefore), for which appropriated funds have been obligated before the later of—

(1) October 1, 2010; or
(2) the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing funds for fiscal year 2011 for
military construction projects, land acquisition, family housing projects and facilities, or
contributions to the North Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Investment Program.
SEC. 2802. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2005
PROJECTS.
(a) ExTENSION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2005 (division B of Public Law 108-375; 118 Stat. 2100),



authorizations set forth in the tables in subsection (b), as provided in sections 2101, 2302, 2401,

and 2701 of that Act, shall remain in effect until October 1, 2008, or the date of the enactment of

an Act authorizing funds for military construction for fiscal year 2009, whichever is later.

(b) TABLES.—The tables referred to in subsection (a) are as follows:

Army: Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations

State Installation or Location Project Amount
Hawaii Schofield Barracks Combined Arms Collective Training 32,542,000
Facility
Air Force: Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations
State Installation or Location Project Amount
Arizona Davis-Monthan Air Force Base Replace Family Housing (250 units) | 48,500,000
California Vandenberg Air Force Base Replace Family Housing (120 units) | 30,906,000
Florida MacDill Air Force Base Replace Family Housing (61 units) 21,723,000
Construct Housing Maintenance 1,250,000
Facility
Missouri Whiteman Air Force Base Replace Family Housing (160 units) | 37,087,000
North Carolina | Seymour Johnson Air Force Base | Replace Family Housing (167 units) | 32,693,000
Texas Goodfellow Air Force Base Replace Family Housing (127 units) | 20,604,000
Defense Wide: Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations
Agency Installation or Location Project Amount
Defense Logistics Agency Naval Air Station, Oceana, Virginia Bulk Fuel Storage Tank 3,589,000
Tri-Care Management Activity | Naval Air Station, Jacksonville, Florida | Hospital Addition/Alteration | 28,438,000
Army National Guard: Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations
State Installation or Location Project Amount
California Dublin Readiness Center (ADRS) 11,318,000
Indiana Gary Armed Forces Reserve Center 9,380,000
Army Reserves: Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations
State Installation or Location Project Amount
Texas Corpus Christi (Robstown) Controlled Humidity Storage, Phase | 9,038,000

\l

SEC. 2803. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2004

PROJECTS.

(a) ExTENsION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of the Military Construction

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2004 (division B of Public Law 108-136; 117 Stat. 1716),




authorizations set forth in the tables in subsection (b), as provided in sections 2302 and 2701 of

that Act, shall remain in effect until October 1, 2008, or the date of the enactment of an Act

authorizing funds for military construction for fiscal year 2009, whichever is later.

(b) TABLES.—The tables referred to in subsection (a) are as follows:

Air Force: Extension of 2004 Project Authorizations

State Installation or Location Project Amount
California Travis Air Force Base Replace Family Housing (56 units) 12,723,000
Florida Eglin Air Force Base Replace Family Housing (279 units) 32,166,000

Army National Guard: Extension of 2004 Project Authorizations

State Installation or Location Project Amount
New Mexico Albuquerque Readiness Center, Add/Alt (ADRS) 2,533,000
Pennsylvania Fort Indiantown Gap Multi-purpose Training Range 15,338,000

XXIX—GENERAL PROVISIONS

[Previously transmitted to Congress]




	Second Package Feb 28 2007-Bill Text.pdf
	Army: Outside the United States
	Total
	Army: Unspecified Worldwide
	Amount
	Navy: Outside the United States
	Navy: Unspecified Worldwide
	Amount
	State

	Air Force: Unspecified Worldwide
	Amount
	Total
	Defense Agencies: Outside the United States
	Defense Agencies: Unspecified Worldwide
	Amount

	SEC. 2802.  EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2005
	Army:  Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations
	Defense Wide:  Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations
	Army National Guard:  Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations
	Army Reserves:  Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations

	SEC. 2803.  EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2004
	Air Force:  Extension of 2004 Project Authorizations
	Army National Guard:  Extension of 2004 Project Authorizations



